	
	
	



[image: ]

Please Note:
This template is intended for educational purposes only, without any express or implied warranty of any kind, including warranties of accuracy, completeness, or fitness for any particular purpose.  You agree that your use of the template is without any recourse whatsoever to PG&E, SCE, SDG&E, or their affiliates. The template is a draft, and anyone using this document should seek the advice of an attorney to develop appropriate ordinance language to meet its jurisdiction’s specific needs, as state and local laws may differ.

This document is the product of a collaborative effort between Peninsula Clean Energy, Silicon Valley Clean Energy, and the Local Energy Codes team. 

Please contact the Codes and Standards Local Energy Codes Team at info@LocalEnergyCodes.com for additional information.




This program is funded by California utility customers and administered by Pacific Gas and Electric Company, San Diego Gas & Electric Company (SDG&E®), and Southern California Edison Company under the auspices of the California Public Utilities Commission and in support of the California Energy Commission.

DRAFT

DRAFT




	
2025 Existing Single Family 
Electric Readiness
Model Reach Code
Version 2.2
February 2026
Context
This document is intended to be used in conjunction with companion materials which are available at LocalEnergyCodes.com and BayAreaReachCodes.com. These materials provide important information that is necessary to develop, adopt and implement the reach code.
Scope
· All single family buildings that undergo certain improvements must include measures to enable future conversion of gas appliances to electric appliances,
· To include the FlexPath policy, use the Flex Path, Readiness and Cool Roof  model code at LocalEnergyCodes.com.
Instructions
Jurisdictions may wish to modify elements of the ordinance, such as those marked in blue text and those marked with comments. When modifying the language, ensure all references are maintained and that the ordinance still meets the CEC requirements. Also, edit the Purpose section to reflect the changes.
Amendments to the State Code appear in strikeouts (deletions) and underlines (additions). Text in blue is for staff reference and should be removed from the final ordinance.
The draft ordinance text is provided as an example only and intended as a starting point for customization for creating an ordinance that aligns with state and local requirements.  Ensure all ordinance materials are reviewed and verified by relevant jurisdiction staff and the city/county attorney. 


Changes from Prior Versions
Please check LocalEnergyCodes.com to obtain the latest version of this document and supporting materials.  This document will be updated frequently to comport with new features in the Cost Effectiveness Explorer.
	Since Version
	Change

	2.2
	Simplified reference in Section 150.0

	2.1
	Simplified exception 1.

	2.0
	Reformatted. Moved FlexPath to a separate model code. Consolidated exceptions.



 




ORDINANCE NO. _________ 
 
AN ORDINANCE OF THE [GOVERNING BODY]
OF THE [CITY/TOWN/COUNTY] OF [JURISDICTION]   
AMENDING [IDENTIFY SUBPARTS, INCLUDING CHAPTERS, DIVISIONS, ETC.] OF THE [JURISDICTION] CODE TO REQUIRE ELECTRIC APPLIANCE READINESS FOR CERTAIN SINGLE FAMILY PROJECTS AND ADOPTING REQUIRED FINDINGS
Recitals and Findings
· See companion materials for guidance.

Section 100.0 is modified to add a new section (i) as follows:
(i)	Single Family Building Remodel Energy Reach Code - Purpose and Intent. 
In addition to all requirements of the California Energy Code applicable to Single Family building additions and alterations, the electric readiness measures specified in Section 150.0(w) shall be required for certain single family additions and alterations.

Section 100.1(b) is modified by adding the following definitions:
LEVEL 2 ELECTRIC VEHICLE (EV) CHARGING RECEPTACLE is a 208/240-volt 40-ampere minimum branch circuit and a receptacle.
LOW POWER LEVEL 2 ELECTRIC VEHICLE (EV) CHARGING RECEPTACLE is a 208/240-volt 20-ampere minimum branch circuit and a receptacle.

The first two paragraphs of Section 150.0 SINGLE-FAMILY RESIDENTIAL BUILDINGS – MANDATORY FEATURES AND DEVICES are modified to read as follows:
Single-family residential buildings shall comply with the applicable requirements of Sections 150.0(a) through 150.0(vw).
NOTE: The requirements of Sections 150.0(a) through 150.0(v) apply to newly constructed buildings. Sections 150.2(a) and 150.2(b) specify which requirements of Sections 150.0(a) through 150.0(wv) also apply to additions or alterations.

A new Section, (w), is added to Section 150.0 as follows:
(w)	Electric Readiness for Alterations
1.	Electric range. Where branch circuits or receptacles are added or altered in a kitchen and the work requires an electrical permit, install electrical components in accordance with the California Electrical Code. The electrical components shall include either of the following: 
A.	A 125 volt, 20 amp electrical receptacle that is connected to the electric panel with a 120/240 volt 3 conductor branch circuit rated at 50 amps minimum, within 3 feet from the appliance and accessible to the appliance with no obstructions. Both ends of the unused conductor shall be labeled with the word “spare” and be electrically isolated. Space shall be reserved for a single pole circuit breaker in the electrical panel adjacent to the circuit breaker for the branch circuit and labeled with the words “Future Use”. 
B.	A pathway for a future 240 volt 50 amp minimum branch circuit that shall consist of either conductors or raceway from the main electrical service panel. The main electric panel shall have space reserved to allow for the installation of a double pole circuit breaker for a future electric range installation. The reserved space shall be permanently marked as “For Future 240V use”. The raceway or conductors shall terminate at a junction box within 3 feet of the appliance. The blank cover shall be identified as “240V ready”.
2.	Electric dryer. Where a branch circuit is added or altered within 3 feet of a gas or propane clothes dryer and the work requires an electrical permit, install electrical components in accordance with the California Electrical Code. The electrical components shall include either of the following:	Comment by Author: CUSTOMIZATION: Optional measure for 240V heat pump dryer, 120V products are on the market that can operate on circuits as small as 120V/15A.
A.	A dedicated 125 volt, 20 amp electrical receptacle that is connected to the electric panel with a 120/240 volt 3 conductor branch circuit rated at 30 amps minimum, within 3 feet from the appliance and accessible to the appliance with no obstructions. Both ends of the unused conductor shall be labeled with the word “spare” and be electrically isolated. Space shall be reserved for a single pole circuit breaker in the electrical panel adjacent to the circuit breaker for the branch circuit and labeled with the words “Future Use”; or,
B.	A pathway for a future 240 volt 30 amp minimum branch circuit that shall consist of either conductors or raceway from the main electrical service panel. The main electric panel shall have space reserved to allow for the installation of a double pole circuit breaker for a future heat pump dryer installation. The reserved space shall be permanently marked as “For Future 240V use”. The raceway or conductors shall terminate at a junction box within 3 feet of the appliance. The blank cover shall be identified as “240V ready”.
3.	Heat pump water heater. 
A.	If wall framing is removed or replaced within 3 feet of a gas or propane water heating appliance, space suitable for the future installation of a heat pump water heater (HPWH) shall be provided. The space shall be at least 2.5 feet by 2.5 feet wide and 7 feet tall and shall include a condensate drain that is no more than 2 inches higher than the base of an installed water heater and allows natural draining without pump assistance or installed piping or tubing within 3 feet of the water heater location to a condensate drain or exterior location. If pump assistance is needed, a receptacle on a 120 volt, minimum 15 amp branch circuit for a condensate pump must be available within 3 feet of the water heater location.
B.	Where branch circuits are altered or added within 3 feet of an existing gas or propane water heater or within 10 feet of the designated future location of a heat pump water heater as required under Section 150.0(w)3A, and the work requires an electrical permit, install electrical components in accordance with the California Electrical Code. The electrical components shall include either of the following:
i.	A dedicated 125 volt, 20 amp electrical receptacle that is connected to the electric panel with a 120/240 volt 3 conductor, 10 AWG copper branch circuit rated at 30 amps minimum, within 3 feet from the water heater and accessible to the water heater with no obstructions. Both ends of the unused conductor shall be labeled with the word “spare” and be electrically isolated. Space shall be reserved for a single pole circuit breaker space in the electrical panel adjacent to the circuit breaker for the branch circuit and labeled with the words “Future 240V Use”; or
ii.	A pathway for a future 240 volt 30 amp minimum branch circuit that shall consist of either conductors or raceway from the main electrical service panel. The main electric panel shall have space reserved to allow for the installation of a double pole circuit breaker for a future HPWH installation. The reserved space shall be permanently marked as “For Future 240V use”. The pathway shall terminate at a junction box within 3 feet of the appliance. The blank cover shall be identified as “240V ready”.
[bookmark: _Ref200965931]4.	Outdoor gas appliances. Where a gas line is added or extended to any pool water heater, spa water heater, sauna, fireplace, outdoor cooking appliance, or outdoor heating system, install infrastructure and reserve physical space to accommodate future installation of an electric equivalent of that system that serves the same function, as certified by a registered design professional or licensed electrical contractor.	Comment by Author: NOTE: Optional Item - applicant would be subject additional design work if this item were required.
A.	Install conduit designed to serve a future electric appliance(s) with the same function, including the appropriate voltage, phase, minimum amperage, and an electrical receptacle or junction box within five feet of the appliance that is accessible with no obstructions, in accordance with manufacturer requirements and the California Electrical Code. In lieu of or in addition to conduit, electrically isolated branch circuit wiring may be installed; and
B.	Label both ends of the unused conduit or conductors “For Future Electrical Appliance”; and
C.	Reserve circuit breakers in the electrical panel(s) for each branch circuit, appropriately labeled; and
[bookmark: _Ref201055067]D.	Designate physical space for future electric appliances, including equipment footprint, on the construction drawings. The footprint necessary for future electric appliances may overlap with the location of currently designed combustion equipment.
Exception to Section 150.0(w)4: Generator systems used for emergency power generation.
[bookmark: _Ref201054985][bookmark: _Ref200971530]5.	Electrical Power Upgrades. Increases in the electrical power infrastructure capacity serving a building shall only be permitted when all the following are documented and submitted to the building official:
A.	Calculations in accordance with California Electrical Code Article 220.83 determining future loads will exceed the capacity of the current electrical power infrastructure.
B.	Where data is available, calculations in accordance with California Electrical Code Article 220.87 determining that future loads exceed the capacity of the current electrical service infrastructure.
C.	Calculations for item (A) and item (B) above shall include at least one of the following:
i.	At least one power management or circuit controlling device, serving electric-only appliances such as:
a.	Water heater(s)
b.	Clothes dryer(s)
c.	Range(s)
d.	Level 2 EV Charging Receptacle or 
e.	Low Power Level 2 EV Charging Receptacle
ii.	At least one of the following electric-only appliances operating on 120V:
a.	Water heater(s)
b.	Clothes dryers(s)
c.	Range(s)
iii.	Circuit control between whole home load and Level 2 EV Charging Receptacle or Low Power Level 2 EV Charging Receptacle
Exception to Section 150.0(w)5: The upgrade is solely the result of a project proposing electrical improvements supporting loads related to devices and uses not regulated by 150.0(w).
Exception 1 to Section 150.0(w): The project is solely related to any of the following: a repair as defined by Title 24 Part 2 Section 202; medically necessary improvements; seismic safety improvements; safety improvement to remove a known hazard; or Emergency Housing pursuant to Appendix P of the California Building Code.	Comment by Author: CUSTOMIZATION: Edit as needed.
Exception 2 to Section 150.0(w): If an electrical permit is not otherwise required for the project other than compliance with this section. 
Exception 3 to Section 150.0(w): Where upgrades to the existing electrical panel or utility service are not proposed, electrical panel capacity shall not be required to exceed the existing utility electrical service to the building to meet compliance with this section. Capacity and overcurrent protection spaces shall be reserved to the extent allowable under the existing electrical panel capacity using the methodology in Section 150(w)5. Tandem overcurrent protection devices shall be used to the extent permissible under the California Electrical Code.
Exception 4 to Section 150.0(w): Mobile Homes, Manufactured Housing, or Factory-built Housing as defined in Division 13 of the California Health and Safety 12 Code (commencing with Section 17000 of the Health and Safety Code).
Exception 5 to Section 150.0(w): Creation of a new accessory dwelling unit or junior accessory dwelling unit that is within the existing space of a single family dwelling or accessory structure and includes an expansion of not more than 150 square feet beyond the same physical dimensions as the existing accessory structure. An expansion beyond the physical dimensions of the existing accessory structure shall be limited to accommodating ingress and egress.  Or, if the project would not otherwise be a Covered Single Family Project were it not for the inclusion of an accessory dwelling unit or junior accessory dwelling unit that meets the criteria above.

The first paragraph of Section 150.2(a) is modified to read as follows:
(a) Additions. Additions to existing single-family residential buildings shall meet the requirements of Sections 110.0 through 110.9, Sections 150.0(a) through (n), (p), (q), (w), and either Section 150.2(a)1 or 2.

The first paragraph of Section 150.2(b) is modified to read as follows:
(b) Alterations. Alterations to existing single-family residential buildings or alterations in conjunction with a change in building occupancy to a single-family residential occupancy shall meet the requirements of Section 150.0(w) and either Item 1 or 2 below.


OTHER ORDINANCE SECTIONS
Severability. If any word, phrase, sentence part, section, subsection or other portion of this amendment or any application thereof to any person or circumstance is declared void, unconstitutional, or invalid for any reason, then such word, phrase, sentence, part, section, subsection, or other portion, or the prescribed application thereof, shall be severable, and the remaining provisions of this amendment, and all applications thereof, not having been declared void, unconstitutional or invalid, shall remain in full force and effect. 
CEQA. This ordinance is categorically exempt from CEQA because it is an action taken by a regulatory agency for the purpose of protecting the environment (CEQA Guidelines Section 15308). In addition, this ordinance is exempt from CEQA under the general rule, 15061(b)(3), on the grounds that these standards are more stringent than the State energy standards, there are no reasonably foreseeable adverse impacts, and there is no possibility that the activity in question may have a significant effect on the environment. The following findings are made in support of these determinations: 
1.	The purpose of the implementation of a Reach Code is to reduce the amount of greenhouse gas emissions in the [Jurisdiction] that are produced from buildings. 
2.	The Reach Code approval process requires that the [Jurisdiction] determines that the local standards will require buildings to be designed to consume less energy than current statewide requirements. Furthermore, the California Energy Commission approval process requires that the [Jurisdiction] make the findings as part of its approval process. Therefore, the Reach Code standards can only go into effect if they protect the environment by making buildings more efficient.
Violations. Violation of the requirements of this Chapter shall be considered an infraction of the [jurisdiction Municipal/County Code], punishable by all the sanctions prescribed in [cite local reference to infractions]. 
Effective Date. This ordinance shall become effective and enforceable as of [Date], upon approval of the California Energy Commission or upon the date the California Building Standards Commission (CBSC) accepts the ordinance for filing, whichever is later.

2026-02-11		1
image1.gif
CALIFORNIA

CODES & STANDARDS
A STATEWIDE UTILITY PROGRAM




